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14/06/24 

STAFFORD BOROUGH COUNCIL - DEVELOPMENT 
LIST OF PLANNING APPLICATIONS - WEEK ENDING 14 JUNE 2024 

View planning applications via Public Access 
 
 

Heading Application Information Applicant/Agent Proposal and Location Type of Application 

 
APP NO 
 
VALID 
 
PARISH 
 
WARD 
 
UPRN 

 
23/38214/FUL 
 
7 June 2024 
 
Hyde Lea 
 
Seighford And Church 
Eaton 
 
 10023357689 

 
Mr John Busby 
Billington Farm  
Billington 
Stafford 
Staffordshire 
ST18 9DQ 

 
Proposed pick your own 
facility, farm shop, cafe, 
children's activity area, dog 
walking area and 
associated car parking 
 
Land North East Of 
Billington Farm 
Billington Bank 
Billington 
 
 

 
Full Application  
  Vanessa Blake 
 
Map Reference: 
E:389123 
N:321129 

 
APP NO 
 
VALID 
 
PARISH 
 
WARD 
 
UPRN 

 
24/38563/FUL 
 
3 June 2024 
 
Bradley 
 
Seighford And Church 
Eaton 
 
200001316185 

 
 Mr W Mason 
C/O Bi Design 
Architecture Ltd 
FAO D Buttrill 
79 High Street 
Repton 
DE65 6GF 

 
Conversion of an 
agricultural barn to a 
residential unit including 
the alteration and upgrade 
of fabric to accommodate 
new windows and doors 
and the construction of 
new garage, entrance 
gates and boundary walls 
and associated patio, out 
door kitchen and amenity 
spaces 
 
Eaton Brook Farm  
Woollaston Lane 
Church Eaton 
 
 

 
Full Application  
  Mr S Owen 
 
Map Reference: 
E:386214 
N:315902 

 
APP NO 
 
VALID 
 
PARISH 
 
WARD 
 
UPRN 

 
24/38866/HOU 
 
11 June 2024 
 
Standon 
 
Eccleshall 
 
200001318219 

 
 Mr and Mrs Tim and 
Carolyn Ellis 
C/O Mr Carl Croft 
6 and 7 Pearl House 
Anson Court 
Stafford Technology 
Park 
Beaconside 
Stafford 
ST18 0GB 
United Kingdom 

 
Demolition of conservatory 
and pergola. Two storey 
side and rear extension 
and associated minor 
landscape works. 
 
Gorse Bank House  
Sandy Lane 
Cranberry 
 
 

 
Householder  
  Sian Eggington 
 
Map Reference: 
E:382823 
N:335770 

 
APP NO 
 
VALID 
 
PARISH 
 
WARD 
 
UPRN 

 
24/38912/FUL 
 
28 May 2024 
 
Stone Town 
 
St Michaels And Stonefield 
 
200001332109 

 
 Mr R Jeffries 
C/O NL Jones Planning 
FAO Mr Neil Jones 
Duke House Business 
Hub 
Duke Street 
Skipton 
BD23 2HQ 
 

 
Erection of replacement 
dwelling and associated 
hard and soft landscaping 
 
The Chalet  
Nanny Goat Lane 
Stone 
 
 

 
Full Application  
  Hannah Cross 
 
Map Reference: 
E:390478 
N:334350 

 
APP NO 
 
VALID 
 
PARISH 
 
WARD 
 
UPRN 

 
24/38965/FUL 
 
10 June 2024 
 
Forton 
 
Gnosall And Woodseaves 
 
 10002091669 

 
 Fernhill Estates Ltd 
C/O B3 Architectural 
Mr Bruce Johnson 
62 Miles Green Road, 
Bignall End 
Stoke-on-Trent 
ST7 8LQ 

 
Ground Mounted PV 
(Solar) Panels 
 
Fernhill Farm  
Fernhill Road 
Sutton 
 
 

 
Full Application  
  Gillian Morrell 
 
Map Reference: 
E:375835 
N:322581 

https://www.staffordbc.gov.uk/planning-public-access
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14/06/24 

Heading Application Information Applicant/Agent Proposal and Location Type of Application 

 
APP NO 
 
VALID 
 
PARISH 
 
WARD 
 
UPRN 

 
24/38966/FUL 
 
10 June 2024 
 
Barlaston 
 
Barlaston 
 
100032198364 

 
 Berry 
C/O Epoch Architecture 
Ltd 
Mr Jonathan Hargreaves 
12 Robin Hill 
Biddulph Moor 
Staffordshire 
ST8 7NN 
 

 
Proposed single storey 
rear extension to extend 
function room and provide 
terrace over. Proposed two 
storey front extension to 
create new entrance and 
increase provision of 
existing sanitary facilities 
and provide ladies 
changing area and 
committee room. Proposed 
elevational treatments and 
outdoor seating area with 
pergola and new fencing. 
 
Barlaston Cricket Club 
Malthouse Lane 
Barlaston 
 
 

 
Full Application  
  Teresa Dwight 
 
Map Reference: 
E:389639 
N:338745 

 
APP NO 
 
VALID 
 
PARISH 
 
WARD 
 
UPRN 

 
24/39054/HOU 
 
7 June 2024 
 
Church Eaton 
 
Seighford And Church 
Eaton 
 
200001316263 

 
 Mrs V Bates 
C/O Mr N Gallier 
94 Broomfield Road 
Admaston 
Telford 
Shropshire 
TF5 0AX 

 
Single storey side/rear 
extenstion 
 
2 Brookside Cottages 
Church Eaton Road 
Church Eaton 
 
 

 
Householder  
  Sian Eggington 
 
Map Reference: 
E:384248 
N:317817 

 
APP NO 
 
VALID 
 
PARISH 
 
WARD 
 
UPRN 

 
24/39074/LDC 
 
6 June 2024 
 
Colwich 
 
Haywood And Hixon 
 
200001319819 

 
 Mr Mark Edwards 
C/O Mr Robert Mills-
Pereira 
1 Tower Road 
Felixstowe 
IP11 7PR 
United Kingdom 

 
Lawful Development 
Certificate Existing - 
Confirmation that the 
premises have been used 
for a continuous period of 4 
years as a single dwelling 
prior to the date of the 
application 
 
Lock House Restaurant  
Trent Lane 
Great Haywood 
 
 

 
Lawful Development 
Certificate_Existing  
  Gillian Morrell 
 
Map Reference: 
E:399616 
N:322663 

 
APP NO 
 
VALID 
 
PARISH 
 
WARD 
 
UPRN 

 
24/39078/HOU 
 
10 June 2024 
 
Doxey 
 
Doxey And Castletown 
 
 10093134350 

 
 Mr J Galloway 
C/O Mr. Amandeep 
Singh 
29 
Century Road 
Oldbury 
B69 4AN 
United Kingdom 

 
Single storey garage 
connection and conversion 
to include new doors and 
windows to front of garage. 
 
23 Lapwing Place 
Doxey 
Stafford 
 
 

 
Householder  
  Sian Eggington 
 
Map Reference: 
E:390480 
N:323539 

 
APP NO 
 
VALID 
 
PARISH 
 
WARD 
 
UPRN 

 
24/39130/LDC 
 
11 June 2024 
 
Weston 
 
Milwich 
 
200001319914 

 
 Centralis Development 
Solutions Limited 
C/O Mark Winslow 
71-75 Shelton Square 
Covent Garden 
London 
Greater London 
WC2H 9JQ 
United Kingdom 

 
To confirm material 
commencement on 
application 21/34300/REM 
 
Land Adjacent Salt Works 
Farm 
Salt Works Lane 
Weston 
 
 

 
Lawful Development 
Certificate_Existing  
   
 
Map Reference: 
E:397608 
N:326537 
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14/06/24 

Heading Application Information Applicant/Agent Proposal and Location Type of Application 

 
APP NO 
 
VALID 
 
PARISH 
 
WARD 
 
UPRN 

 
24/39136/HOU 
 
11 June 2024 
 
Stone Town 
 
St Michaels And Stonefield 
 
100031795256 

 
 Mrs S Tolley 
C/O ME Design 
Solutions 
Mr Mathew Eaton 
27 Braithwell Drive 
Milton 
Stoke On Trent 
ST2 7NT 

 
Proposed new off road 
parking to front of property 
including new dropped 
kerb and the addition of 
fencing 
 
66 Mount Road 
Stone 
Staffordshire 
 
 

 
Householder  
  Sian Eggington 
 
Map Reference: 
E:389546 
N:334889 

 
APP NO 
 
VALID 
 
PARISH 
 
WARD 
 
UPRN 

 
24/39154/COU 
 
14 June 2024 
 
Fulford 
 
Fulford 
 
100032209756 

 
Mrs S Roberts 
Chestnut Grange 
Windmill Hill 
Rough Close 
Stoke-On-Trent 
Staffordshire 
ST3 7PJ 
 

 
Change of use from 
guesthouse (C1) to 
dwellinghouse (C3) 
ancillary to the main 
dwelling. 
 
Chestnut Farm 
Windmill Hill 
Rough Close 
 
 

 
Change of Use  
   
 
Map Reference: 
E:392643 
N:339646 

 
APP NO 
 
VALID 
 
PARISH 
 
WARD 
 
UPRN 

 
24/39209/HOU 
 
13 June 2024 
 
 
 
Highfield And Western 
Downs 
 
100031758269 

 
 Mrs J Kowalchyk 
C/O Mr Myk Kaszuba 
16 Lingfield Ave 
Fordhouses 
Wolverhampton 
WV10 6NZ 
 

 
Proposed single storey 
side extension 
 
100 Bagots Oak 
Highfields 
Stafford 
 
 

 
Householder  
  Sian Eggington 
 
Map Reference: 
E:391146 
N:321493 

 
APP NO 
 
VALID 
 
PARISH 
 
WARD 
 
UPRN 

 
24/39226/HOU 
 
12 June 2024 
 
 
 
Doxey And Castletown 
 
100031779747 

 
 N Shaw 
C/O Mr Ben Rayner 
Offis, Falcon Point 
Floor 2 
Park Place 
Cannock 
Staffordshire 
WS 12 2DE 

 
Proposed single storey 
rear and side extension 
 
12 Russell Street 
Castletown 
Stafford 
 
 

 
Householder  
  Sian Eggington 
 
Map Reference: 
E:391768 
N:323115 

 
APP NO 
 
VALID 
 
PARISH 
 
WARD 
 
UPRN 

 
24/39223/HOU 
 
11 June 2024 
 
Stone Town 
 
St Michaels And Stonefield 
 
100031793431 

 
 J and L Grant 
C/O Mr Carl Croft 
6 and 7 Pearl House 
Anson Court 
Stafford Technology 
Park 
Beaconside 
Stafford 
ST18 0GB 
United Kingdom 

 
Single Storey Rear 
Extension and Alteration 
 
24 Granville Terrace 
Stone 
Staffordshire 
 
 

 
Householder  
  Sian Eggington 
 
Map Reference: 
E:390332 
N:334136 

 
APP NO 
 
VALID 
 
PARISH 
 
WARD 
 
UPRN 

 
24/39224/TCA 
 
5 June 2024 
 
Ingestre 
 
Milwich 
 
 10002088609 

 
 Mr Brown 
C/O Mr George Brown 
Carter Jonas, Two 
Snowhill 
Snow Hill Queensway 
Birmingham 
B4 6GA 
United Kingdom 

 
Fell a cypress tree to 
ground level. The 3m tree 
has dieback and it's stems 
are overweighed as is 
typical for the species. 
 
School House  
Ingestre Park Road 
Ingestre 
 
 

 
Tree Works in 
Conservation Area  
  Steve Dores 
 
Map Reference: 
E:398240 
N:324495 
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14/06/24 

Heading Application Information Applicant/Agent Proposal and Location Type of Application 

 
APP NO 
 
VALID 
 
PARISH 
 
WARD 
 
UPRN 

 
24/39249/TWT 
 
6 June 2024 
 
Fulford 
 
Fulford 
 
100032198003 

 
The Applicant 
Grindley Lane 
Blythe Bridge 
Stoke-On-Trent 
Staffordshire 
ST11 9JS 

 
TPO No. 127 - 1983 -  
Sycamore(T9) removal of 
dead wood and crown lift.  
Ash(T8) removal of dead 
wood. 
Ash(T6) branch removal 
and cut ivy 1m at base and 
remove dead wood. 
Sycamore(T7) branch 
removal and cut ivy 1m at 
base. 
 
Squirrels Leap 
Aynsleys Drive 
Blythe Bridge 
 
 

 
Tree Work in TPO  
  Steve Dores 
 
Map Reference: 
E:395082 
N:341180 

 
APP NO 
 
VALID 
 
PARISH 
 
WARD 
 
UPRN 

 
24/39230/HOU 
 
12 June 2024 
 
Stone Town 
 
St Michaels And Stonefield 
 
100031797073 

 
 Mrs R Selby 
C/O Mr Carl Croft 
6 and 7 Pearl House 
Anson Court 
Stafford Technology 
Park 
Beaconside 
Stafford 
ST18 0GB 
United Kingdom 

 
Small rear extension for a 
shower 
 
82 Station Road 
Stone 
Staffordshire 
 
 

 
Householder  
  Sian Eggington 
 
Map Reference: 
E:389860 
N:334371 

 
APP NO 
 
VALID 
 
PARISH 
 
WARD 
 
UPRN 

 
24/39232/HOU 
 
7 June 2024 
 
Eccleshall 
 
Eccleshall 
 
200001328376 

 
 Mr R Satongar 
C/O Mr Matthew Parr 
5 Laburnum Road 
Birmingham 
B30 2BA 
 

 
New double garage with 
conservatory and office at 
first floor. 
 
9 Horsefair 
Eccleshall 
Stafford 
 
 

 
Householder  
  Sian Eggington 
 
Map Reference: 
E:383143 
N:329027 

 


